

BID2021-64 FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR WITH AN OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR FOR THE CITY OF TRENTON, DEPARTMENT OF WATER AND SEWER, WATER FILTRATION BID OPENED 9/15/2021 AT 11:00AM

BID2021-64 FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE FOR A PERIOD OF ONE (1) YEAR WITH AN OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR FOR THE CITY OF TRENTON, DEPARTMENT OF WATER AND SEWER, WATER FILTRATION PLANT				
NUMBER OF RESPONDENTS:	4			
NAME OF BIDDER	BRENNTAGE NORTHEAST, LLC	UNIVAR SOLUTIONS, USA, INC.	SHANNON CHEMICAL CORPORATION	INDCO INC.
ADDRESS	81 W. HULLER LANE	200 DEAN SIEVERS PLACE	P.O. BOX 376	511 ESSEX STREET
CITY, STATE, ZIP	READING, PA 19605	MORRISVILLE, PA 19067	MALVERN, PA 19355	GLOUCESTER CITY, NJ 08030
CONTACT NAME	KIRSTEN O'DONNELL	VICTORIA MEAKIM	DANIEL C. FLYNN	JOE MCNAMACA
TELEPHONE	484-818-1687	267-397-4074	610-363-9090	856-456-6100
FAX	N/A	877-310-2155	610-524-6050	856-456-1904
E-MAIL	KODONNELL@BRENNTAGE.COM	VICTORIA.MEAKIM@UNIVARSOLUTIONS.COM	DCFLYNN@SHANNONCHEM.COM	JMCNAMACA@INDCOINC.COM
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
DISCLOSURE OF INVESTED ACTIVITIES IN IRAN	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA DATE 9/9/2021	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
REQUIRED EVIDENCE AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATIONS QUESTIONNAIRE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT OF 1990 LANGUAGE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE FOR CONTRACTOR	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	REQUIRED PRIOR TO AWARD
EIC	CERT.#55 EXP. 08/15/2021 (EXPIRED)	CERT.#28919 EXP. 08/15/2023	CERT.#11490 EXP. 07/15/2027	CERT.#6704 EXP. 02/15/2027
MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY EXHIBIT A	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
DEBARMENT NOTICE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
ETHICS COMPLAINT DISCLOSURE	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE	REQUIRED PRIOR TO AWARD	REQUIRED PRIOR TO AWARD	REQUIRED PRIOR TO AWARD	REQUIRED PRIOR TO AWARD
CITY OF TRENTON RESIDENT EMPLOYMENT POLICY	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED	INCLUDED
60-DAY EXTENSION COMPLIANCE	YES	YES	YES-120 DAYS MAXIMUM	YES
COMPLIANCE WITH EMERGENCY SERVICES	YES	YES	YES	YES
THREE (3) REFERENCES W-9	INCLUDED N/A	INCLUDED INCLUDED	INCLUDED INCLUDED	N/A N/A
UNIT PRICE PER TON	\$891.00/\$2.70/LB FOR KMNO4 PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS	\$945.28 FOR KMNO4 PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS	\$1,399.19 FOR KMNO4 PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS; MANUFACTURER: ORGANIC INDUSTRIES, INDIA	\$1,969.00 FOR KMNO4 PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS
TOTAL BASE PRICE FOR YEAR ONE (1) FOR 400 DRUMS	\$356,400.00	\$378,112.00	\$559,676.00	\$787,600.00
OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR				
OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR UNIT PRICE PER TON	\$908.82 FOR KMNO4 PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS	\$945.28 FOR KMNO4 PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS	\$1,424.29 FOR KMNO4 PER ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS; MANUFACTURER: ORGANIC INDUSTRIES, INDIA	NO BID-MARKET TOO VOLATILE
OPTION TO EXTEND ONE (1) YEAR TOTAL BID PRICE FOR 400 DRUMS	\$363,528.00	\$378,112.00	\$569,716.00	NO BID-MARKET TOO VOLATILE
EXCEPTIONS (IF ANY)	NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE
FATAL FLAW	NONE	NONE	NONE	NONE

1

**PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
TY 2021/CY 2022**

AWARDED FORM DATE OF AWARD TO DECEMBER 31, 2021

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, $KMnO_4$ as per the attached specifications.

Quantity	Description	Unit Price Per drum	Total Bid Price
400 drums	$KMnO_4$ per attached specifications	\$ <u>891.00</u> \$2.70/lb	\$ <u>356,400.00</u>

Kirsten O'Donnell
Respectfully Submitted

Kirsten O'Donnell
(Signature)

Brenntag Northeast LLC
(Company)

Person to Contact: Kirsten O'Donnell

Telephone Number: 484-818-1687

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

**PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
CY 2023 – Option to Extend the contract for one (1) year**

OPTION TO EXTEND THE CONTRACT FROM JANUARY 1, 2022 TO DECEMBER 31, 2022

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, KMnO₄ as per the attached specifications.

Quantity	Description	Unit Price Per drum	Total Bid Price
400 drums	KMnO ₄ per attached specifications	\$ <u>908.82</u>	\$ <u>363,528.00</u>

Kirsten O'Donnell
Respectfully Submitted

Kirsten O'Donnell
(Signature)

Brenntag Northeast LLC
(Company)

Person to Contact: Kirsten O'Donnell

Telephone Number: 484-818-1687

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

2

**PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
TY 2021/CY 2022**

AWARDED FORM DATE OF AWARD TO DECEMBER 31, 2021

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, $KMnO_4$ as per the attached specifications.

Quantity	Description	Unit Price Per drum	Total Bid Price
400 drums	$KMnO_4$ per attached specifications	\$ 945.28	\$ 378,112.00

Victoria Meakim, Municipal Specialist

Respectfully Submitted


(Signature)

Univar Solutions USA Inc.

(Company)

Person to Contact: Victoria Meakim, Municipal Specialist for bid related issues 267-397-4074 victoria.meakim@univarsolutions.com
Jimmy Tedesco Account Manager jimmy.tedesco@univarsolutions.com 732-215-6331
Customer Service for orders, invoices, deliveries, (877) 561-6990

Telephone Number: 267-397-4074

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

**PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
CY 2023 – Option to Extend the contract for one (1) year**

OPTION TO EXTEND THE CONTRACT FROM JANUARY 1, 2022 TO DECEMBER 31, 2022

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, KMnO₄ as per the attached specifications.

Quantity	Description	Unit Price Per drum	Total Bid Price
400 drums	KMnO ₄ per attached specifications	\$ 945.28	\$ 378,112.00

Victoria Meakim, Municipal Specialist

Respectfully Submitted


(Signature)

Univar Solutions USA Inc.

(Company)

Person to Contact: Victoria Meakim, Municipal Specialist for bid related issues 267-397-4074 victoria.meakim@univarsolutions.com
Jimmy Tedesco Account Manager jimmy.tedesco@univarsolutions.com 732-215-6331
Customer Service for orders, invoices, deliveries, (877) 561-6990

Telephone Number: 267-397-4074

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

3

**PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
TY 2021/CY 2022**

AWARDED FORM DATE OF AWARD TO DECEMBER 31, 2021

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, KMnO_4 as per the attached specifications.

Quantity	Description	Unit Price Per drum	Total Bid Price
400 drums	KMnO_4 per attached specifications	\$ 1,399.19	\$ 559,676.00

Manufacturer: Organic Industries, India

Daniel C. Flynn

Respectfully Submitted

DCM-

(Signature)

Shannon Chemical Corporation

(Company)

Person to Contact: Daniel C. Flynn

Telephone Number: 610-363-9090

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

**PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
CY 2023 – Option to Extend the contract for one (1) year**

OPTION TO EXTEND THE CONTRACT FROM JANUARY 1, 2022 TO DECEMBER 31, 2022

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, KMnO_4 as per the attached specifications.

Quantity	Description	Unit Price Per drum	Total Bid Price
400 drums	KMnO_4 per attached specifications	\$ 1,424.29	\$569,716.00

Manufacturer: Organic Industries, India

Daniel C. Flynn

Respectfully Submitted



(Signature)

Shannon Chemical Corporation

(Company)

Person to Contact: Daniel C. Flynn

Telephone Number: 610-363-9090

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT



**PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
TY 2021/CY 2022**

AWARDED FORM DATE OF AWARD TO DECEMBER 31, 2021

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, KMnO₄ as per the attached specifications.

Quantity	Description	Unit Price Per drum	Total Bid Price
400 drums	KMnO ₄ per attached specifications	\$ 1969. ⁰⁰	\$ 787,600.

Joe McNAMARA
Respectfully Submitted

Joe McNAMARA
(Signature)

INDCO
(Company)

Person to Contact: Joe McNAMARA

Telephone Number: 609-839-4377

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT

**PROPOSAL
TO
TRENTON WATER WORKS
FOR
Potassium Permanganate
CY 2023 – Option to Extend the contract for one (1) year**

OPTION TO EXTEND THE CONTRACT FROM JANUARY 1, 2022 TO DECEMBER 31, 2022

The undersigned proposes to furnish and deliver to Trenton Water Works, Water Filtration Plant, John Fitch Parkway, Trenton, New Jersey, $KMnO_4$ as per the attached specifications.

Quantity	Description	Unit Price Per drum	Total Bid Price
400 drums	$KMnO_4$ per attached specifications	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid

Joe McNamara
Respectfully Submitted

MARKET TOO
VOLATILE

Joe McNamara
(Signature)

INDCO INC
(Company)

Person to Contact: Joe McNamara

Telephone Number: 609-839-4377

PRICES SHALL BE FIRM FOR THE LENGTH OF THIS CONTRACT